As Pascod by tha
. Tr .‘I?ii.ll:"': | Fal. '.--l-.'-1 ,?_‘ 5".:: !'t_
RN.L TELMUL/2016/73158 " [Price ¥ Rs, 9-00 Paeer "
HSE No. 1051/2020-2022
Soomrey Trasd(hadod
THE TELANGANA GAZETTE

PART IV-A EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No.1] HYDERABAD, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 24, 2021.

TELANGANA BILLS
TELANGANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

The following Bill was introduced in the Telangana
Legislative Assembly on 24th March, 2021.

L.A. BILL No. 1 OF 2021.

A BILL FURTHER TO AMEND THE TELANGANA
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION OF AGE

OF SUPERANNUATION) ACT, 1984.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Telangana

in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of India as
follows:- '

1. (1) This Act may be called the Telangana Public Short
Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation) E:"g
(Amendment) Act, 2021. oty

mence-
[1] ment.

B. 197 (RSN)

Scanned with CamScanner



TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

[Part IV-A

Amend-
ment of
Section
3.
(Act
No. 23
of 1984)

(2) It shall come into forr_:e on such date the State
Government may by notification in the Telangana Gazette,

appoint.
2 In the Telangana Public Employment (Regulation of

Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984, In section 3,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words *fifty eight years”
the words “sixty one years" shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (1A), for the words “sixty years” the
words "“sixty one years" shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (2), for the words "“sixty years” the
words "sixty one years" shall be substituted,

(iv) in sub-section (3),-

(a) for the words “sixty years” the words “sixty one
years" shall be substituted:

(;_:) in the Explanation-Il, in clause (a), for the words
“fifty eight or sixty years or sixty five years” the words “sixty
one years or sixty five years” shall be substituted:

(v) in sub-section (4),-

(e:) _in clause (a), for the words “fifty eight years” the
words "sixty one years" shall be substituted:

N (b) in clause (b), for the words "sixty years" the words
Sixty one years” shall be Substituted.

Scanned with CamScanner



March 24, 20211 TELANGANA OAZL 1L LXTRAORDINAIY
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

J

The age of supoerannuation ol parsons appointad (o public
services and posts in connection with the affairs of e Slata of
Telangana 1s regulated by the provistons ol tho lolangana Pablic
Employment (Requlation of Ago of suparannuation) Act, 1084 As
per the existing provisions of tho said Act, the ngo ol nuparannuastion
s S8 years in respect of Government omployoon, 60 yoarsin rospect
of members of State Higher Judicial Sorvicos and State Judicial
Service, Last Grade Services employees and Workmoen and 65 yoars
in respect of teaching faculty in Government Medical Colloges.

The issue of enhancing the superannuation age for
government employees has been under considoration of the
Government for some time for reasons such as increase in life
expectancy, health conditions and late entry into Government service
due to increase in the qualifying age. Tha issue was accordingly
referred to the First Telangana Pay Revision Commission for
examination. The Pay Revision Commission in its report
recommended to increase the age of superannuation for Government
employees from 58 years to 60 years. Government have considered
the report of the Pay Revision Commission and after further
consultation with various Employees and Service Associations and
due examination of all the relevant factors, decided that it would be
appropriate to enhance the age of superannuation for all State
Government Employees, whose age of superannuation at present
Is 58 years or 60 years, to 61 years, by suitably amending the

Telangana Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation)
Act, 1984,

This Bill seeks to give effect to the above decision.

T. HARISH RAOQ,
Minister for Finance.

Scanned with CamScanner



